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Newellton Pep Talk

From Page 1

* Tensas Purish Home-
land Sccurlty tests lhe
Grand Guif nuclear si-
rens at {] a.m. on the
first. Wednesday of every
month,

« QOnconta Baptist
Church hosts the Tood
Bank ol Northeas! Loui-

W food

to Inrmhcs and scniors nn
the third Saturday of cach
month

Doors open at B am
and remain so until all Tood.

baxes are distributed-

« The Tensas Parish
Police Jury meeis at 10
a.m. on the second Tuesday
and fourth Tuesday of each
month at 212 Hancock SI.
in St Joseph. Phone: 766-
3542

¢ The Tensas Parish
Schoal Board meets ai §
pm. on the second Thurs-
day of each month at the
Mcdia Center.

* The Newellton Vil-
lage Council meets at 5:30

p.m. every second Wednes-
day al 1876 Hwy 605 in
the Newellton Conlerence
Room,

¢ The Waterproof Vil-
lage Councll meets ut 5
pn. cvery second Monday
of cach month.

* The St. Joscph Vil
lage Council meets al 6
p-m. on the thid Monday
of cach month, The meet-
ing will be on the third
Tuesday if Monday is a
holiday. Phonc 766-3713

for more information,

» The Lake Bruin Rec-
reation and Water Con-
servation District meels
ot 6 p.m. the first Tuesday
of each month at the Lake
Bruin Country Club

» The Tensas Parish
Communication District
meets at 4:30 pan. the
third Tuesday of January,
March.  fune. Scptember
and December at the Ten-
sas Parish Police Tury of-
fice in St Jaseph

By Ruby Lee Gipson

Strength for the Day is
dedicated 1o the Keepers.

Faith in the Keepers
The Door into the fold:

The Anchor that will
hold:

The Shepherd of (he
sheep:

The Guardian of my

Sleep

Remember: Good. bel-
ter best »= pewer led B orest
until your pood is betler
and your better is besl.

Joel 3:16 — The Lond
ill be the hope of His
people

Public Notices.

NOTIUE TO SELL STANDING
TIMOER ON NELLIE.
ROBINSON ESTATE:

All land fying Eau of US
1IWY. 75 kocated in Tems Parish
lotsling approsimaely 10439
s more panicularly described
a folleas: WU2 of v

Any cppenition 10 the propmed
sale mua be fited within scven
dan from the date of the la
iian. Any oppusinon may
e lled onty by an helr legsie.
ar credior.

V19,2726

Cotiv 80

VILLAGE OF NEWELLTON
REGULAR MEETING
JANUARY 8, 2015

CALL TO ORDER: The Baunl
of' Aldcruan met in i regular ses-
sion. an January B, 2015 at 5:30
pmn. in the Newellion Confercnce
room, These present were Deborah
Parvon, Richund Harris. Manvin
Brady, Mayor Frankic Robinson,
awd Puiricia Washington. Alsa
Present was Chiel  Deswond
Forl, Joe Percy. Alethu Caner,
Iris Rolling. Christy Lee, Jackic
Ford, Odesa Cliase, Breadu
Washington  Jack  Washinglon.
Morgun Curier, Morgun South,
Annie Marshall, Roanie Tumer St,
Altia Nash, Mut Eva Thainas, Pan
Wilioa, Latanya Tyler. Dorothy
Binghaun, Wanda Thernas, Deloris

Gentry. 4m! Shaw anly Walker
PRAYER: There being a quorum
et Apentle Ronnie. Tumer St
ned the meeting with 3 prayer
SWEARING IN OF VILLAGE

current Chief of Police, and Ci
Clerk were all swam in by Cleik
of Court Chaisti Lee

carried the minutes were appros

as appeared in the Tens Gazelte,

DILLS: On a molion hy Richard

Haris teconded hy Dehorah

Panon and unanimeusly_carried

the bille were approved for pay-
et s funds become available
TS: M

PUBLIC COMMI
Glenda Gibelutle with Louisisna
Rural Water came (o introduce
berself 10 the new board members
and mayor.

APPOINTEE POSITION OF
MAYOR PRO TIM APPROVAL-
On a motion by Richard Ilarris
sccanded by Marvin Brady and
unanimously camied Deborah
Panon was selected as the Mayor
Pro Tem

RESOLUTION APPROVAL OF
NEW BANK SIGNATURES: Ona
mation by Marvin Brady sccunded
by Richard Ilarris and unanimous-
Iy caried the ofd names Timothy
Tumer and Mattic Sampson were

remoned fr e srmt il
Frankie Robinson and Deborah
Parumi were Sdabey

MONTIILY MEETING DATE
CHANGE  (PER  AUDITOR
WOODARD  &ASSOCIATES)-
Gn a metion by Deborah Paron
weonded by Richard arriy
and unanimeusly carried the
monthly mceting for the illage
wac changed from lhe sevond
Wadnieulsy of the month (6 the
Ind Wedneslsy each month
'UTIVE SESSION: On a
mation by Deborh Panon sec-
onded by Marvin Brady and unani-
mously carried the beard wenl et
of regular scusion inlo cxecutive
session, On o motion by Manin
Brady seconded by Richard Harric
and unaninwously carried the board
wenl out of cxecutive session buck
into regular session. Action taken
was Thomas Clark was sclected
as the new gas operator for the
Village of Newellton and his pay
rae will be the same as the prov-
ous nperator of $500. 00 monthly.

ADJOURN: On a motion by

Marvin Brady sccanded by
Richanl Ilais the meeting was
adjourned

FRANKIE  ROBINSON
MAYOR

PATRICIA  WASHINGTON.
CLERK

216

Const |5 I8T£0

J'I J.il.IL hOTICE

NQTICE

Naice it hereby given that, ia
aconbance with LR S 3:1609 and
TAC 7 XV3 L4 (A) the Lowiviana

Department of Agnculure &
Foresiry, Louiviana Boll Weevil
Eradication  Commivsien.  has
cuablishal a boll weeil cradi-

Eradicalion Zone con.
all the temitory within the siale of

Lovisians.

Netice i funther given that all
producers of commercial cotten
in Lovisiana are reguired (o par-
ticipate in the boll weevil eradi-
cation progrom  includiog cont
sharing, in accordance wilh the
Boll Weevil Eradication Law and
regulations This includes, bul is
ned limited Lo, reporting of cation
acreage and destruction ol colton
plants and stalhs by December 31
of cach crop year. A topy of the
law and rules and regulations may
be obtained from the Bolt Weevil
Endication Commission, 5825
Plorida Blvd. Sie, 1001, Balon
Rouge, La.  70ROS, Lelephone

number (225) 922-1338
Notice is also given that the
pl:mlms of noncommercial cotl-
ton is PROUBITED in Louisiana
obui

Agrivulwre & Forextry in accor
dance with LAC 7:XV.3IHC). To
request a waiver, submit a writien
application ta the Depannical of
Agriculiure and Rarestry, at Lhe
address provided in his notice,
stating the canditions under w hich
such written waiver is requested

19, 270, 15
Gun iy
PUBLIC NOTICE
The Federal  Emergency
Management Agency. the Stare
of Lovisiaaa Depanment  of
Quality.  the

Lou
Homncland Securily and Emeegency
redness, the Teasas Paridh
Otfice of Homeland Security &
v . as well
ax, Grand Guif Nuclear Staion /
Enlergy Operabons. Inc. will hold
o virtual public mecting via Zvom
(hitps Jffema zoomgoy com/j/1610
324594 7w d=ITa2qNAqbucXcW
Mok ByaKWHeIEG L.

Call in: 646-821-7686, Meeling
ID: 161 032 4594, Pastcode:
454743) a1 10:00 AM on Tuesday.

arch 25, 2025, The meeting will

be beld (o provide n overview

af the rsults of the Radialogical

Emrrgtnry Preparednessexer-

conducted with Grand Guu
Nuclear Saticn on Tucsday,

18, 2025, For. addivons, inl’nr—

mation, comtact Oscar Maninez

Regional Assistance

Commities. Federal Emergency

76209, or call ‘NCL“)—‘IJM
5. M2
Couing19 %

TENSAS PARISH POLICE JURY
REGULAR MEETING
Jasuary 2s, 2025

10:00 A!

The Tensas Purish Pulive Jury met this duy in mguhr seasivn convened There were prescal the fullowing

officers and members to-3 it:
Db Rushing, Presidect
e

Members: Dilly Fit A
Watson

Toudd Mermiett, Ivisation

Pidnert t-lsik. P Alleihanie

s by )LL\

Tindd Sderrivat. Thrbman Dol
v |

Crigler, dily voce

£ upd

3T ‘.\uunqm Fatiing Diyle o
tiakante [Repuarts Tidhil Sereriots wpslel
i Sandeit tipdatad the Sy on (g

Vatsami, duls b

arafTreasrer
st (absent), Roben Clurk, Dill Sid Crigler. Cluy Rnter, Terrence South, und Alex

il pubic ez

waded by
ick, Aehive L nl.,o.
hl.cJ-n

asdegt 1y DA Crigher. it w

e hasy I\ Marhon ¢ aried

ol
ey 11|||n— pler: i |vu|||r4|ll 1
M

LA 1||-n\|r-

j ugpre=d 1y uppeve tr miln-

" v

!
cwital,

il sppesd s illos Sammirs

- pbriad s spprve e

Tabed, cnidernt
TABULKI'ION OF DIDS FOR MAIN'I'ENANCE MATERIALS FOR FISCALYFAR 2028

REGULAR COLD MIX:

Diamond D. Consuction Co , LLC ONLY BIDDER RECOMMEND ACCEITANCE

P 0 Box 768

Aleasndrin. LA 71306 Tekephune (318M27-1381 -JefYery Davis

Price

v ton delivered to the Parish Maintenance Unit $143.00tan

per
IGH PERFORMANCE COLD MIX:

NO BIDDER

Price per tun delivered w (be Purish Maigtanance Uit $000Ava

Sowtt P;Wlmm Curp ONLY BIDDER RECOMMEND ACCEPTANCE

L8 Hwy. &

Serviday, LA vnuTcu-pn.mc (318)757-397S -Jereruy Sutheramd
r st dre freight, masgin, profit and overhead caleulated per galloa to be added to the rack price at he

of delivery. Prices include applicable tuaes

N 2Bk Highuay Diesel (clear)
Nu 2 Of-Ruad Diescl (dyed) 30,148/
87 Dictime Gascliris \Not ithasnl)

50 1Wgal

il
50 14%/gal

GRAVEL & SAND CLAY GRAVEL:
APAC - MS LOWEST BIDDER RECOMMEND ACCEPTANCE

101 Riverview Dr.

Richlal, MS 39218 Telephone (601)940-9240 - e’
Prive per wnvniite delivered from source to Paridh A4

Wi

Distance [rom source (o Parish Maintenance Unit: 55.0 miiles

Prive ut source:
Coane Sand $8 00/Ton
Cluy Gravel $00 00/Tim

Washed Maintenance Gravel $22 00/Ton

Washed Ovenized Rovks No 2

30,00/ Tun

Price delivered lo Teasas Parish Maintenance Unil:

Counse Sand
Clay Gravel
Washed Maintenance Gruvel
Waslied Ovensized Rocks No I
Johnsville Co, LLC

y Remd Sn

5800+ $13.50 elisery
$00.00 + 500.00 delivery $00 O(Vrnn
$22.00 + $13.50 delivery 5 ST
$30.00 + 51350 delw:ry

v se'nx.r.r'rew. e (HTEREAY AT
s Farish M

= 1 Tharlsls lluuu unce L

521 5WTon

1 Fermdl

0 i

native Unil: $0 24546

fon
) 50Ton

i
inkessasay Unin: 50,24

Diescl engine «
Chrvion Dela
Diesel Ethaud Flual (DEF)
Diresel Exhaurt Fluid (DEF) bl

‘\1J_II\--‘A]

(55 gul)  $560.00 ca

(S gal)  $560.00 ca

{55gn) (7500 ca

(pergal) $3.00/gal

Trunsmissive/Drivemuin vil ~SAE 30w (TO-4 spov) (55 gul)  $68000 a1

Bulk Hydraulic Qil-SAE Mw ie. Chevron THF

CULVERTS:
Tristate Culverts, LLC
553 US Hwy 65 N

Average ppli for (6) vizes mal
Caastal Culvert & Supply, b
PO Box 1145

Eismii, LA 70535 Teleplnime (1770064067
I & e, ol O
e i Ak Cusded

Average pphf i |
CRUSIIED LIMESTON

RECOMMEND ACCEPT

il

e (FTOIIAS-TENY SWinde Becker

ket Gals: el

4 Caated

L0 SSML

in

=
7T 59/

(pergal) $9.5Wgal

LOW-BID ITEMS ONLY

LUW RID

$50MAM

Termal RiverService LOWEST RIDDER - RECOMMEND ACCEPTANCE

707 Levee Ruad
Vidalia, LA 71373
10100 flwy. 65 S

Lake Providence. LA 71281 Tidepluss 318-136-4707 -Sarah Calhoun

Grade Price a1 Source § per ton | Delivery/Ton = 46 miles 1 50.26 | Toiat Price | Parish
Acceplance
BOA NO BID 1196
sB-2 NO BID siiig
¥ $1500 1196 sov | X
M $44.00 51196 s5s96 | X "
57 $40.50 31196 s | X
610Bauc | $950 119 [
7" Oversized | $40 50 51196 ss146 | X
4 $40 S0 $11.96 $5246 X
R-200 $4500 51196 $56.96 X
APAC~-MS
101 Rivervicw Dr.
Richlznd, MS 39218 Telephone (801)40-9240 -Jed Stevens
Grude Price st Sunrce $ per n | Delivery /Ton = 77.5 iles 1 5024546 | Tuial [P s 74 o b
Price | Acveptance
DGA NO BID 51900
sB2 NO BID 51900
Lu NO BID $1900
" NO BID $19.00
57 $17.00 51900 55600
§10Base | 53600 519.00 55500
2 Qvensized | NO BTD 9.0
& NO BID $19.00
R-200 NO BID 51900

$4.75/Ton

510 50/Ton

Wished Mainierunce Gravel - $20.50/Tva
Washed Oserrized Rocks No 2 $00 00/Ton
Prive delivered tv Tansss Parish Muintenance Ul

Coarse Sand $4.75 + 528 40 delivery $43 15/Ton

Clay Cewval $10.50 + SIB.40 delivery KWI'un

Warted Mentenance Gravel  $20.50 + S‘N 40 dch\tr) 18 90/Ton

‘Washed Ovensized Racks No 2 +$00 00 lkll\try $00 00/Tun

LUDBRICATION FLUIDS:
Scuit Petroleunt

6921 Huy &

Ferviday, LA 7175 Tl
Chevron Delo 100 5DE 15w .00 (CK4 spec.)

Shell Rotella-T 15W-40 (CK-1spec) (S5 2:d)
Dicsel engine oil -SAE 30w (SS @) $H260¢a
Chevron Dela 400 XLE 104-30 (55 gal) $903 10 e
Dicsel Eshaust Fluid (DEF)  (55.gal) 510780 ¢a

Dicacl Exlraust Fluidl (DEF) bulk (per gul) SLORgal
Transmission/Drivetrain oil ~SAE }rw (TO] spee) (55 gal)  S775 w e

Bulk Hydruulic Oil-SAE 30w i.c. Chevrun THE  (per gul) § L7

Satety-Klcen Systems, Inc.  LOWEST RIDDER  RECOMMEND ACCF_Vn\\CI:
Lungwaler Drive

Norwcll, MA 07061 Telephone (781 H27-3060 -SVP of Sales

Chevruu Delo 400 SDE 15w-40 (CK spec) (S5 gul)  SSK0.00 en

Shell Rotella-T 15W-10 (CK spee) (55 gal)  5560.00 ea.

w (31R)757-3975 -Jeremy Sutheriand
(S5 gal) S90)eSea
SKI765 en

Upor a motinn by Bill Crigler, duly sccoaded by Temrence South, it was unanimausly agroed U uppriee bav-
ing Told Merriet test the o from Sufcty-Kicen Sysewns. Inc. 1o be sure it meets our specifications. Ayes have

o il e

ol O wpeh

i prvived. Aget Py
Lu.—-- ek iros

won. Bild Ceigheny
Motion carvied.
Ut 8 st by Torromss Saiith, aluty
naming e parkl i Wessliron tha Hmenlis A far
sy Clay Foster, ituly secvastad 1y |m|i_n.|

<ph the Hcx fhel-Hin] Wil £

Nkt & Hlnl
enle regalat

w i

Uy oo by Termrmer 3ot ol
31,50 et hease 1 wmyon
Crigheryei Cly B ok,
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Famed lawman learned to shoot properly in Tensas Parish

By John Black
Spacial Repodl

‘The Bonduront family
nume in Teusas Parish goes
back ta the carly 1800s.

Reportedly the first white
child born in what would be-
come Tensas Parish was Al-
bert Bondurant born in 1824.
The name Albert Bondurant
is an often-used family naroe
and at least five generations
have had an Albert Bondu-
rant

This article pertains v the
grandson uof the first men-
tioned Albert Bondurant.

Albert Gay Bondurant
was bomn in 1893 He would
fulfill a life of civil service
in Tensas Parish. First, he
would serve as a deputy
sheriff for a pumber ol years
and then wark as the assis-
tant 12 assessor. He would
fater be elected as Lax asses-
sor for Tensas Parish and
serve six lerms reliring from
that position in 1968.

Albert Bondurant was an
avid outdoorsman, hunter
and gun collector. He had
been given the gun Elion
Coleman had {elled Huey P.
Long's assassin, Carl Weiss.
with. According 1o onl sto-
ties and tradition. this is the
gun with which he taught
one of his friends to shoot.

The friend he taught to
shoot was William Henry
Jordan, who moved into
Tensas Parish as a young
man and worked as a ci
engineer [or the stale high-
way deparument.

William “Bill"  Jordon
and his young wife lived in
Tensas Purish [or approxi-
morely seven yeurs. both
being involved in the local
affuirs of seciety and civic
life. Jordan was no person of
small slature as he stood six
feet five inches il

In 1939, Mr Jordan
moved o Texas and started
u job with the United States
Border Patrol. Svon afler

starting this job, he was
drafted in the U.S. Marine
Corps amd served as an in-
telligence ofticer and also
served clearing caves of Jap-
anese snipers on the islands
of [wo Jima and Eniwetok as
well as the Marshall Tslands,
He served wilh the Marines
until 1946 when he tetirned
to service with the Border
Pauol.

During Bill Jordan's time
with the border patral he
developed many tactics and
accessories  that  changed
law enforcerent. He was re-
spansible for developing the
holster system thal would
became (he standard for law
enforcement for decades to
come, the Jordan or Border
Patrol style of holster and
belt system.  He was also
largely responsible for con-
vincing Smith and Wesson
o adapt their K-frame re-
valvers to be chambered for
the .357 magnum cartridge.

Bill Jordan acquired the

reputation of “the fusiest
maa on the draw.” He eould
draw his revulver and shool
4 target in a quarter of a sec-
ond. There are vidcos of him
dropping a ping pong ball
and tossing another into the
air and drawing and hitling
the one tossed before the one
bt deopped Bit the graund.
He woa bunidreds of trophics
and competitions and camed
the title that he caried for
being (he fastest man on the
draw.

Many carly readers of
Field and Strcam magazine
or American Shooter maga-
zine may be familiar wilh
the name Bill Jordan. He
wrote numerous articles de-
tailing his time and service
with the border patrol. Nota
man to bask in the glory, Bill
Jordan was a rather shy and
reserved persan publicly.

Bill Jordan retained his
fricndship with Albert Bon-
durant and would retum Lo
Tensas Parish cvery year

Willlam Henry “BIII” Jordan

during hunting ssason. He
retlred frim (he hocder pa-
tralin 1971
ol eervice
“Bill” Jardan passed away

in 1997 anihi age of eighty-
five. He wan o legend ond
Just muiyhe Tensss Fatish
played 1 part in the making
ol the legend

Public Notices

NOTICE
Natice is herehy given that, in
acconlasce with LR S 1:1609 end
LAC 2:XV.314 (A). the Lovisiana
Departineat of Agriculure &
Forcir. Louiians Bl Wil

Callin: 646-828-7666, Meetmg
ID: 161 032 4S04, Pumsende:
4$4743) ut 10 00 AM b0 Tucnday,
Masch 25, 2025 The mecting will
be held 1 proside an overview
of the reaults of the Radialogical

has
estublished a holl unﬂll eradi-
calion  zone, the Laouisiama

Eradication Zonc. consisting of’
all the tecritory within the uate of

Notice is furtler given that ull
producers o commersial volton

cation piogram, including. cost
hurin, i accordice wih the

1ot limited 10 teporting of cotton
acreage and desiruclion of cotlon
planis and stalke by December 31
uf uch crop year. A copy of the
Jaw und rules and regulations may
e oblained from the Ball Weesil

Eradicalion Comminsion. 825
Florida BIvd Ste, 2002 Baton
Rouge, La \elerhone

Tox06
number (129 922-1235,
Nodee is aba given thal the
planting ol nencommercial cot-
ton is PROJNBITED in Louisiana
unlens u written waiver i< obtained
irom the Commisvioner  af
Agriculture & Fewesury in mecor-
dunce with LAC XV 19(C). To
sahtntt 5 wrbien

weh welltvn wiahnpe by tegpentsd

2449, 226 35
Coringr

PUBLIC NOTICE
The Federal  Emergency

Management Ageacy, the Staie
of  Louisions  Deparunent  of
Gnvirnmental  Quality.  the
Louisisna Gosemor's Otlice uf
Homeland Security s Enicrgenvy
Prepaiedness, the Tensas Parish
Office of lomeland Security &
Emergency Preparcdness, os well
15, Grand Gull' Nuclear Stion /
Enteryy Operations. Inc. will hold
a virtuat public mecting ¥ia Zoom
(hups/ifema soomgoy com/j/1610
3245047 pwd=12a2NAghue X W
mkot Ry 4K WheqlEG.1,

erer-
cise rondlk(nl with Grad Gulf
Nuclear Siarion on Toesday, March
18, 2025 For additional infor-
malion, conlect Oscar Maminez,
Chaimenwn, Regional Auistance
Cuinmittee, Federal Emrgency
Management Agency, Region 6.
R00 N, Loop 288, Denwn, TX
T6204, or call HO-INI-7I64
S W19

Cotin§19 0

PUBLIC NOTICE

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO

INTRODUCE LOCAL BILL

Public nctice is hereby given.
us required bry Anicle 111, Section
13 of the Louisiana Constitution
of 1974_ ol the intention 1o intm-
duce in the regular session of the
Legislawre of Louitiana for the
year 2025, which is st w ©
cne on April M, 2025, 1
relative lo the Noctheast Lovivians
Multinwdal  Dixt 1o define
powers of the distict; and to pro-
vide lur reluted nutters

2726 35

Couiataw

PUBLIC NOTICE
NOTICE OF INTENTION TO
INTRODUCE LOCAL BILL
Public notice is herchy given,
|as required by Article U, Secton
13 of the Louisiana Constimtion
lor 1974. of the inlcntinn 1 intro-
Idurt in the regulur sexion of 1he
Legislamre af Louisiana for the
vear 2025, which is se1 0 camvene
on April 14, 2025, a bill relarve
llo the 1suance ol bonds by the
(Tensas Parish Port, Harbur amd
{Terminal Distact; and 10 provide
Tor related maiers.

TENSAS I"ARIbH POLICE

REGULA'R M}:Emc
February L1, 2025
10:00 AM
The Tensas Purish Police Jury
met this day in regular session

cunvened. There were
prescnt the follinwing witicers
and members To-wit

Terrence Sauth, Vice-President

Palive Doyle, Secretary/
Treasurer

Members: Billy Joe Arcencaur,
Robent Clark, Dill Sid Crigler,
Clay Fomter, Temence South
Dubbs Rushing (absent). and Alex
Watson

Tod Mervictt, Imvecation

Dilly Jue Arencaus, Pledge of
Allegrance

Guest presenl were: Twdd
Merrictt, Thelinun Dradtord, Kiley
Sardden, and Hyram Copeland

There were 10 commients from
the gencral public regarding the
agendda itenkn)

Uran « nwtion by Bifl Crigler,
duly scconded by Billy Joc
Arcencaur, it was agreed 1o
ihe agenda to remove Ttem #19
from the agenda and add  state-
ment of record Roll call sote
taken: Billy Jo¢ Arcencaut-yes,
Robert Clarkeyes, Bill Crigler-yes,
Clay Fower-yes, Bubbs

Rushing-ancot. Terence South-
yes. Alex Wasonyo. Ayes buve
it Mution can

Upon a mwtion by Dill Crigler,
duly seconded by Billy Joe
Arcencaux, il was unanimously
agreed 10 approve the ogenda 25
prinied with the remosal of lem
#19 and the additivn of a statement
of record. Ayes have it Modion
caried.

Statememt  of Regord: ~The

Sevretary-Treauurer doct not agree
or sign o on with paragraph 5 on
page 6 (uise fur emiployec ¥1-A)
because the proper procedures
were not followed.”

Statemem
Vice-Pravident, sitting

of Record: The
tor the

“Lbelieve thal someene i Irying 1o
sabotape the Jury”

4 motion by Bill Crigler.
duly scconded hy Billy Joc
Arceneaut it was upanimously
ugreed 1o spprove the minuley
for the Regular Meeting beld on
January 28, 2035, Ayes bave iL
Mution carried.

Upon o motian by Alex Watson
duly seconded by Dill Crigler,
it was unanimawsly agreed to
wpps e payinent of bills us nuln-

nzed by the Tinance Cammuttce
Ayes have it. Motion carri

Presidents Report: No repurt
ghen

Sevretary/Treasurer Report: No
repont given

Superintendents Report: Todd
Merriett updated the Jury on ongo-
ing Maintznasce Unit wark- repor
atached

OEP Repan: Kiley Sanders
updated the Jury en cngoing OFP
activities.

Upon a malion by Bill Crigler.
duly seconded by Alex Waloa.
it was ununimoudy agreed o
approve the Rudget vs, Actual
Financial Statements for the perind
ending January 31, 2025

Upan a mabon by Robert Clark,
duly seconded by Dill Crigler.
it was unanimouly agreed o
approve the ateence ol Dilly Joe
Arcencaux from the regular meet-
ing held on January 28, 2025 Ayes
hase it. Mutirn carried.

Upan a miolion by Ales Watwon
duly secomled by Robert Clark
it was unanimously ugieed to
approve a request from the Village
of Walerprool. Ayes hme it
Motion vamicd

Upon a motion by Bill Crigler.
m.|, seconded by Clay Foser,

wae unanimously  agreed
1 approve o Resalulion of
Appreciation and Dedication 10
Gail Walers for her service on the
Librury Buard fue cightem year
Ayes have it. Motion carried,

RESOLUTION
APPRECIATION

WITEREAS, the Tensas Py
Police Jury adopeed u Resaluton
of Appreciation and Dedicalion
Jor Gail Walers during their
Regular meeting held on the 11
day of February, 2025 and

WIEREAS, Mrs. Waters served
a1 6 Doard Member ol the Tensas
Parish Library Basrd from

2007 uniil 2025, und

WHEREAS, Gail Waler's integ-
rity has carsed her the admira-
tion and fomlness of ull thong that
worked with her, and

LET IT BE RESOLVED, that
the Tensas Purish Police Jury go
on record in procai Mrs
Gail Water's outstanding virmues
as a Board Member of Lhe Tensas
Parisly Library, und

NOW THEREFORE. BE IT
RESOLVED that this Body here-
with esprenes ite wlniiration and
appreciation for (he fifteen years
of faithtul, loyal ard dedicated
srviee Lo the Parich, and

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED,
that the origina o this Resolution
i to be tendered to Gail Waters a5
an capression of the Tensas Parish

Police Jury's sipcerest thankiul-
ness, and
ALSO, BLE IT FURTIER

RESOLVED, that this Resalution
be made a penmanent pan of
thearchives of the Tensas Parish
Potice Jury by incorporaling the
same in the minutes of this meet-
ing
TIUS, DONE AND SIGNED
anthe 111h day of Februury, 2025

/s Dubba Ruthing

Dubba Rushing, President

I Terrence South

Termence South, Vice Precident

1/ Billy Jve Arcencaux

Jurew, Billy Joe Ancencaux

14/ Bill Sid Crigler

Juror, Dill Sid Cigler

13/ Roben Clark

Juna, Rubert Clark

1 Clay Fuster

Juror, Clay Fater

I Alex Watson Jr.

Juror, Alex Watson, JIr.

1. Pauline Dayle, Sectctary/
Treasurec of the Tenwat Parish
Pulice Jury. do herehy certiry that
the forcgoing is 4 toxe und correct
copy of a Revolution adopted by
the Tensas Parich Police Jury at its
Regular Mecting held on the 11th
day of Fehmuary, 2

1 Bauline Doyle
Doyle,
SecretaryfTreasuree

Upon a motion by Bill Crigler
duly scconded by Billy Joe
Arcenzoua, it was unanimously
agreed to mave the industrial stove
irvwn the Community Ceater tn the
Sherill's oltice/jail Ayes hane it
Mlotion carricd.

Upon o motion by Dill Crigler,
duly wconded by Billy Joe
Arcencaun, it wasunanimously
agreed to auction the broken indus-
wriat slave, the water soflener ayy-
tem and he201 | Ford F150 pickup
(ruck in March 2025, Ayes have it
Motion carricd

Iem #19 tabled

Assistant

Upon a mation by Bill Crigler,
duly secanded by Billy Joe
Arcencaux, i w4y unanimously
agreed tn approve a request from
the Comps of Enpineers foc the
Goldboltnm Project Moaring &
Parking on the Mississippi River.
Ayes lave in, Motion carried

Upan a mation by Bill Crigler,
duly seconded by Alex Watson,
it wat unanimously ugreed 1o
apprve the LTC. Tne. invoice 1o
update the wircless access puint in
the Safety Building. Aves have it
Motion carried

Upon a motion hy Bilk Crigler
duly seconded try Robert Clark, it
was agreed (o hire Rozier, McKay,
& Willis to conductihe 2024 Audit
Toc the Tensas Pasish Pulice Jury
Rall call vote 1aken: Dilly Joe
Arcencaur yes, Robert Clark yes,
Dill Crigler-yes, Clay Foster-yes,
Buhba

Rushing-ainent, Termence South-
yes, Alev Wason-yes Ayes huse
it Motian carried

Upon a @ ity Joe
Arcencau, duty soiided by Dill
Crigler, it was unaninosly azreed
1o whjoum. Ayes huse it Motion
carried,

s

CoarbSIH®

PUBLIC NOTICE

The Tensas Parich Police Jury
will hold their regular scheduled
meeting on March 11, 2025 and
March 25. 2025 a1 1000 am in
the Tensas Parith Guvernmental
Cemplex Duilding, Tenwas Parish
Police Jury Meeting Roam, 212
Tlancock Streel, Saint Joseph, LA
71366, Amyone needing rensunable
accommodstion @ attend a public
mecting held by Ure Tersas Parish
Police Jury shoutd contact Pauline
Dugle au 318 766-1542 or by email
paulineioyle @1ppj arg ot by
TTY 1-800-845-5277 al least §
days prier tu the meeting date. I
fiurther information is equired or
needed please contxct (he above
per:

a
This insiitation it an Cqual
()|\pm1umly Provider.
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|IHII Henderson
il Auctions |

Henderson Auction’s 2-Day Public
Year End Auctlon wlll be held on

March 20th & 21st, 2025 | 9am Daily
Consignments Accepted!
Malke Plans to Attend this
Live Event!! 2 Days | 2 Rings
Call today: 225-686-2252 or 1-800-850-2252

Deliver Monday - Friday from 8am-3:30pm
Accepting: Famming, Vehicles, Construction,

m:rxm, Boats, Campers, ATVs, efc..
Auction Dalivery Location:
13340 Florida Blvd.
Livingston, LA 70754
Auction Business Lic # AB439

Auction Detarls at

ndersonAuctions.com
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POWER cumuu
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Dozer mnd Trachhon Avallablo

Ken Templeton - 318-381-3292
PO Box 87 « Rayviite

ke foy

We Buy Houses!

Liz Buys Houses Connects Home Sellers
with Legitimate Cash Buyers Nationwide!
No Repairs. No Fuss,

= Fair Cash Offer
« Quick Closing
« No Realtor Fees

+ No House Repalrs
« Simple Home Sale
« Convenient Closing Date




