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Current law defines a freight-carrying vehicle as every motor vehicle designed for and used primarily as a carrier of freight
transported for commercial purposes, in which the vehicle is licensed for 6,000 lbs or more. This excludes any passenger-
carrying vehicle and pick-up or panel trucks unless the trucks are so heavily loaded with such freight as to exceed 6,000 lbs.

Proposed law allows for a nonrefundable tax credit against state individual, corporate, or fiduciary income tax liabilities for
25%, up to $250 per vehicle, of the purchase and installation costs of a dashboard camera or a telematics system in freight-
carrying vehicles. Each taxpayer is limited to $10,000 in credits per taxable year with a 5 year carryforward. The total
amount of credits awarded each year not to exceed $1M. The purchase/installation must occur during the taxable year for
which the credit is claimed. Taxpayers claiming the credit must maintain records and, if requested, provide them to the
Dept. of Revenue (LDR) when filing a return. No credits may be claimed after tax year 2031.  Eff. for tax years 2026-2031.

The bill is anticipated to increase $178,317 SGR and one (1) T.O. in the Department of Revenue (LDR) in FY27. One time
costs of $85,000 are expected in FY27 related to computer system development and return modifications. LDR reports one
Revenue Tax Specialist 1 with a salary and related benefits of $93,317 will be necessary beginning in FY27 to review and
process returns claiming the proposed credit. The department reports the ability to absorb this amount within its current
budget but may require additional resources if the aggregate impact of all bills enacted during this session is substantive.

The bill can only serve to decrease general fund revenue which would begin in FY27 when 2026 tax returns are first filed.
The LFO has no basis for estimating the anticipated revenue loss associated with the nonrefundable credits offered to
taxpayers under the bill. The uncertainty is due to unknown factors such as how many taxpayers may be willing to purchase
a dashboard camera or telematics system for freight-carrying vehicles or the amount of money that may be spent on such
purchases. The most credits that may be claimed in aggregate any given year is limited to $1M and each taxpayer is limited
to $10,000 per taxable year.

The Office of Motor Vehicles estimates there are approximately 82,900 vehicles currently registered in the state that fit the
criteria for freight-carrying vehicles, although the delineation between private and commercial may leave room for potential
error. LFO has no basis for estimating how many of these vehicles already have dashboard cameras or telematics systems or
how many taxpayers may be enticed to make such purchases for new or existing vehicles in any given year. To illustrate the
potential exposure to the general fund, 4,000 taxpayers claiming $250 credits would cause the program to hit the $1M cap
each year.

Qualifying equipment is the bill is defined as a dashboard camera or telematics system in a freight-carrying vehicle. A
telematics system means a technology that combines telecommunications and informatics to collect, transmit, an analyze
data from the vehicle such as vehicle location, speed, fuel consumption, driver behavior, maintenance needs, etc.

LFO cannot determine an impact if a backlog of credits is in place when the ability to make claims ends in tax year 2032.

Note: The SGF impact may originate as the LDR retention of 1% of income and sales tax collections initially classified as SGR
but ultimately reverted to the SGF for use in the budget. Should LDR reversions cease, this could become an SGR impact.
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