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Current law provides that municipalities and parishes may decide whether to allow charitable raffles, bingo, and keno within
their jurisdictions. Local governing authorities may adopt rules, regulations, and ordinances to license and regulate
charitable gaming conducted by charitable organizations.

Proposed law authorizes children’s charities to conduct charitable gaming activities, including bingo, keno, and video bingo.
It prohibits local authorities from denying or revoking licenses for eligible charities holding a valid Louisiana charitable bingo
license. Proposed law additionally exempts children’s charities from local sales and use tax, to the extent allowable by the
Internal Revenue Code, and all local governing taxes, fees, permits, and reporting requirements. It also establishes
requirements for non-charitable distributors, allows specific equipment use in gaming operations, and creates the crime of
theft of bingo proceeds for employees convicted of stealing $2,500 or more.      Effective August 1, 2025.

Proposed law may result in an indeterminable increase in SGF expenditures in the Department of Public Safety and
Corrections – Corrections Services (DPS&C – CS) if an employee employed by a charitable gaming licensee is convicted of
theft of keno, bingo, or video bingo proceeds in the amount of $2,500 or more. The exact fiscal impact of the passage of this
legislation to state and local governing authorities is indeterminable, since it creates a new crime, and it is not known how
many people will be convicted, nor the length of the sentences assessed as a result of its potential enactment.

For those convicted, sentenced, and then subsequently housed in a state facility, DPS&C-CS will sustain expenditures of
$107.60 per offender per day. For those convicted, sentenced, and then subsequently housed in a local facility, DPS&C-CS
will sustain expenditures of $26.39 per offender per day. DPS&C-CS advises that impacts on offender populations are
anticipated to impact the number of offenders held in local facilities, and in managing its offender population, it seeks to fill
all beds in state facilities first, then assigns overflow offenders to local facilities.

The Office of Charitable Gaming reports one-time implementation costs of $40,000 for system design, development, and
testing, which can be absorbed within their existing budget using SGR derived from licenses and fees.

The Office of Charitable Gaming reports an indeterminable increase ($75 annually per application) in SGR dependent on the
number of organizations that qualify as children’s charities and apply to conduct charitable gaming. This revenue increase
could come from both newly formed organizations and existing nonprofits or licensed distributors that were not previously
engaged in charitable gaming but choose to apply under the expanded authority granted to children’s charities.
Organizations already licensed and conducting gaming would not generate new revenue, as they are already subject to
existing fees.

The exemption of pull-tab sales from local sales and use tax may result in an indeterminable decrease in local revenue,
depending on the volume of pull-tab sales and how the exemption is applied.
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