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Proposed law will likely result in an indeterminable increase in SGF expenditures in the Department of Public Safety and
Corrections – Corrections Services (DPS&C – CS) if a person is convicted of domestic abuse battery or battery of a dating
partner by strangulation that results in serious bodily injury. Proposed law has the effect of adding an enhanced penalty for
those convicted of domestic abuse battery or battery of a dating partner by strangulation that results in serious bodily injury,
providing a minimal sentence of two additional years mandated for those convicted and subsequently incarcerated. The
exact fiscal impact of the passage of this legislation is indeterminable, as it creates an enhanced penalty, and it is not known
how many people will be convicted and incarcerated or the length of sentences imposed on those who are convicted as a
result of this change to current law.

For illustrative purposes, SGF expenditures will increase by $107.60 per offender per day to the extent that an offender is
convicted and then housed in a state facility or $26.39 per offender per day for an offender housed in a local facility.
Corrections Services reports that impacts on offender populations are anticipated to affect the number of offenders held in
local facilities. Corrections Services reports that in managing its offender population, it seeks to fill all beds in state facilities
first, then assigns overflow offenders to local facilities.

For informational purposes, the proposed law increases the minimum term of imprisonment from 3 to 5 years for the crime
of domestic abuse battery or battery of a dating partner by strangulation. DPS&C reports that there have been an average
of 297 admissions in the past three years with an average sentence length of 2.88 years for those convicted of domestic
abuse battery, or battery of a dating partner by strangulation. With enactment of proposed law, offenders would be
required to serve an additional 2.12 years of imprisonment, assuming each of the offenders would receive the enhanced
penalty for committing domestic abuse battery or battery of a dating partner by strangulation that results in serious bodily
injury. Assuming that additional offenders would be housed at the local level, annual expenditures would begin to exceed
$100,000 with the admission of 11 offenders convicted of domestic abuse battery or battery of a dating partner by
strangulation.

Current law provides that for battery of a dating partner or domestic abuse battery that involves strangulation, those
convicted are mandated to be imprisoned at hard labor for not more than 3 years. Proposed law provides that for battery of
a dating partner or domestic abuse battery involving strangulation that results in serious bodily injury, those convicted are
mandated to be imprisoned at hard labor for not less than 5 nor more than 50 years, without benefit of probation, parole, or
suspension of sentence. Current law provides that notwithstanding battery of a dating partner or domestic abuse battery
involving the intentional use of force or violence committed with a dangerous weapon, an offender that intentionally causes
bodily injury, and is subsequently convicted, is subject to a sentence of imprisonment at hard labor for no more than 8
years. Proposed law provides that notwithstanding battery of a dating partner or domestic abuse battery committed by
burning, strangulation, or intentional use of force committed with a dangerous weapon, an offender that inflicts serious
bodily injury, and is subsequently convicted is subject to a sentence of imprisonment at hard labor for no more than 8 years.

There is no anticipated direct material effect on governmental revenues as a result of this measure.
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