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Proposed law generally replaces existing constitutional property tax provisions with statutory provisions, typically utilizing
identical language. Additionally, proposed law establishes an optional local ad valorem tax exemption, provided that multiple
participants including sheriffs, school boards, and parish governing authorities all assent.

For taxing authorities that opt to exempt inventories, the bill partially offsets the resulting revenue reductions with payments
apparently from the Revenue Stabilization Trust Fund (RSTF), specifying payment amounts based on estimates of recent-
year inventory tax collections by parish and whether the exemption is phased in or immediately applied fully.

Effectiveness is contingent on passage of a Constitutional amendment by a statewide election on March 29, 2025, which
would be initiated by HB 7, should it become law.

Proposed law would authorize payments out of existing funds within RSTF to political subdivisions, however further
unspecified legislation would be required to enable and execute the payments. The timing of any such payments is thus
unclear.

The revenue impact of proposed law is generated by the optional exemption for business inventories to local ad valorem
taxes. A taxing authority would become eligible to receive a payment from a state trust fund should they allow the
exemption, a decision which would be irrevocable.

The varying amounts specified for each parish to potentially be awarded are done so in an effort to offset three typical years’
worth of recent inventory tax collections (with a maximum of $15 million) for any parish enacting a full exemption. For
parishes phasing the exemption in, the bill specifies eligibility for a payment that is approximately equal to the actual prior
year’s collections. Over a five-year horizon, the proposal would reduce local revenues for any political subdivision that would
opt in.

The magnitude of any local or statewide fiscal impact is indeterminable, as participation in the exemption is optional for any
taxing authority. For illustrative purposes, in a scenario where each parish opted to receive their one-time payment
authorized via full exemption, approximately $563 million in payments out of the RSTF would be made to political
subdivisions.

For any given political subdivision, the net revenue impact of the proposed bill would be determined by its own decision to
either retain the inventory tax, grant the exemption immediately, or phase it in.

As interest earned on RSTF monies accrue to the general fund under current law, decisions made by political subdivisions to
receive the payment would mechanically reduce the amount of interest-earning money in the fund, and would therefore
impact SGF revenues. For illustrative purposes, in a scenario where interest earnings were approximately 3%, removing
$543 million from the RSTF would reduce interest earnings to the general fund by approximately $16 million (compounding)
annually.
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